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Abstract: Somalia faces a growing yet under-researched burden of diabetes, compounded by con-
flict and humanitarian challenges. This narrative review explores the current understanding of this 
public health concern. Limited access to medications, disruptions in healthcare, and a lack of cultur-
ally-sensitive education programs pose significant barriers to effective diabetes management. How-
ever, examples of successful community-based interventions and collaborations between healthcare 
facilities and international organizations offer hope. Further research on Somali-specific epidemiol-
ogy and risk factors, alongside investment in resource allocation, healthcare worker training, and 
culturally-sensitive education, hold immense potential to improve diabetes outcomes in Somalia. By 
addressing these critical areas, Somalia can empower individuals with diabetes to manage their con-
dition effectively and work towards a healthier future. 
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1. INTRODUCTION 
Diabetes mellitus, commonly referred to as dia-

betes, is a chronic metabolic disorder characterized 
by persistent hyperglycemia resulting from defects 
in insulin secretion or action [1]. This can be 
caused by either the body's inability to produce 
enough insulin (type 1 diabetes) or an impaired 
response of cells to insulin (type 2 diabetes), the 
latter being the most prevalent form [2]. Diabetes 
has emerged as a major global health concern, 
with the International Diabetes Federation (IDF) 
estimating that 463 million adults (aged 20-79 
years) were living with diabetes in 2019, with a 
projected rise to 700 million by 2045 [3]. This rap-
id increase poses a significant threat to healthcare 
systems worldwide, as diabetes and its complica-
tions are major contributors to morbidity and mor-
tality [1]. The economic burden is also substantial, 
with the IDF estimating the global cost of diabetes 
at $760 billion in 2019 [3]. Understanding the 
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prevalence, risk factors, and impact of diabetes 
across diverse populations is crucial for develop-
ing effective prevention and management strate-
gies. 

Somalia presents a unique context for studying 
the burden of diabetes. The country has a long his-
tory of conflict, displacing millions and disrupting 
healthcare infrastructure [4]. This instability has 
hampered the collection of reliable epidemiologi-
cal data on diabetes prevalence [5]. Furthermore, 
the healthcare system in Somalia remains fragile, 
with limited access to specialists, medication, and 
essential supplies [6]. These factors combine to 
create a challenging environment for both the pre-
vention and management of diabetes, potentially 
leading to a higher disease burden and poorer 
health outcomes compared to more stable regions. 

Given the limited availability of robust epide-
miological data in Somalia, this narrative review 
aims to explore the current understanding of the 
diabetes burden in the country. This will be 
achieved through a systematic synthesis of exist-
ing literature, encompassing both quantitative and 
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qualitative studies, reports, and relevant data from 
neighboring countries or the Somali diaspora. 

2. THE LOOMING SHADOW: THE GROW-
ING PREVALENCE OF DIABETES IN SO-
MALIA 

Despite the growing global concern over diabe-
tes, epidemiological data on its prevalence in So-
malia remains notably scarce. This paucity of data 
can be attributed to the country’s prolonged peri-
ods of political instability, economic challenges, 
and an under-resourced healthcare system, which 
have collectively hindered comprehensive health 
surveys and data collection efforts. The limited 
available studies suggest a rising trend in diabetes 
prevalence, mirroring the global increase, yet these 
findings are based on small-scale, often regional 
studies that may not fully capture the national situ-
ation (7). This lack of robust data impedes the de-
velopment of targeted public health interventions 
and policies necessary to address and manage the 
disease effectively within the Somali population. 
Therefore, there is an urgent need for systematic 
epidemiological studies to provide a clearer under-
standing of diabetes prevalence and inform evi-
dence-based health strategies in Somalia. 

In the absence of comprehensive data from 
Somalia, studies from neighboring East African 
countries with similar demographics and risk fac-
tors can provide valuable insights. For instance, 
Ethiopia, a neighboring nation, reports a signifi-
cant diabetes prevalence of around 3% [8]. Addi-
tionally, research on the Somali diaspora in high-
income countries suggests a high susceptibility to 
developing diabetes, likely due to lifestyle changes 
and dietary shifts [9]. Extrapolating from these 
findings and considering Somalia's shared risk fac-
tors like urbanization, dietary changes towards 
processed foods, and limited access to healthcare, 
this review suggests a potentially substantial but 
underreported diabetes burden in the country. 

Somalia faces several risk factors for diabetes 
that are likely contributing to the potential burden. 
Dietary shifts towards processed foods with high 
sugar and fat content, coupled with decreasing 
physical activity levels due to urbanization, mirror 
trends observed globally that contribute to type 2 
diabetes. Additionally, genetic predisposition to 
diabetes may play a role, as studies suggest a 
higher prevalence among Somali populations [9]. 
These factors, combined with limited access to 

healthcare and preventative measures, create a 
concerning scenario for diabetes management in 
Somalia. 

3. BEYOND NUMBERS: THE HUMAN COST 
OF DIABETES IN SOMALIA 

Due to the limited access to healthcare and di-
agnostic tools in Somalia, many individuals with 
diabetes may remain undiagnosed, leading to po-
tentially devastating consequences. Uncontrolled 
diabetes can significantly impact quality of life, 
causing complications such as blindness, neuropa-
thy, and kidney failure. A study by Mohamed et 
al. (2014) exploring the Somali diaspora in Swe-
den highlights the potential human cost, revealing 
a high prevalence of diabetes-related complica-
tions amongst this population [9]. This emphasizes 
the urgency of addressing the diabetes burden in 
Somalia to prevent similar negative health out-
comes for its citizens. 

Diabetes mellitus (DM) significantly burdens 
daily life, requiring meticulous blood sugar moni-
toring, dietary adjustments, and medication adher-
ence [1]. Management strategies can impact quali-
ty of life, with studies highlighting increased emo-
tional distress and difficulties maintaining social 
routines [10]. Furthermore, disparities in socioec-
onomic status and healthcare access can limit med-
ication affordability, jeopardizing glycemic control 
and potentially leading to sight-threatening reti-
nopathy, neuropathy, and cardiovascular compli-
cations [11]. This underscores the need for multi-
faceted interventions that address not only the bio-
logical aspects of DM but also the social determi-
nants of health to optimize patient outcomes. 

4. A FRAGILE HEALTHCARE SYSTEM: 
CHALLENGES IN DIABETES MANAGE-
MENT 

A fragile healthcare system characterized by 
limited access to facilities and specialists poses a 
significant challenge to effective diabetes man-
agement. This disparity hinders crucial aspects like 
regular check-ups, specialist consultations for 
complications, and access to essential medications. 
Studies have shown that such limitations are asso-
ciated with poorer glycemic control, increased risk 
of complications, and ultimately, higher healthcare 
costs [12]. Therefore, strengthening healthcare in-
frastructure, particularly in underserved areas, and 
exploring telemedicine or community-based diabe-
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tes education programs are essential steps to im-
prove diabetes outcomes and reduce healthcare 
burdens. 

Somalia faces a significant challenge in manag-
ing diabetes due to a shortage of medications and 
supplies. Disruptions in the supply chain and lim-
ited healthcare infrastructure often restrict access 
to essential medications like insulin, blood glucose 
meters, and test strips [13]. This scarcity, coupled 
with food insecurity and a lack of trained 
healthcare providers specializing in chronic dis-
ease management, creates a complex scenario 
where complications like neuropathy, retinopathy, 
and kidney failure become more likely [5]. Further 
research is needed to explore the efficacy of cul-
turally-sensitive interventions and resource alloca-
tion strategies to improve diabetes management 
outcomes in Somalia. 

Conflict and displacement pose a substantial 
barrier to effective diabetes management in Soma-
lia. Internal strife and recurring droughts disrupt 
access to healthcare facilities and medication sup-
plies, jeopardizing treatment continuity for diabet-
ic individuals [14]. Displaced populations often 
face challenges securing culturally appropriate 
food options and maintaining a consistent exercise 
routine, further compromising glycemic control 
[15]. This highlights the need for mobile 
healthcare units, culturally sensitive educational 
programs, and collaboration with humanitarian 
organizations to ensure displaced Somalis with 
diabetes have the resources necessary to manage 
their condition effectively. 

5. BEYOND THE CRISIS: STORIES OF RE-
SILIENCE AND HOPE 

Efforts to address diabetes in Somalia combine 
community-based initiatives with support from 
NGOs and international organizations. Community 
health workers facilitate diabetes education pro-
grams delivered in Somali languages, promoting 
self-management strategies like healthy eating and 
blood sugar monitoring [16]. Partnering with 
NGOs like World Diabetes Foundation, healthcare 
facilities can improve access to medications 
through donation programs and subsidized treat-
ment options [3]. Additionally, international or-
ganizations like the International Diabetes Federa-
tion provide technical assistance and training for 
healthcare providers, strengthening diabetes man-
agement capacity within Somalia. These collabo-

rative efforts demonstrate the potential for multi-
sectoral approaches to improve diabetes outcomes 
in conflict-affected settings. 

Despite the multifaceted challenges, examples 
of successful diabetes management in Somalia 
showcase remarkable resilience. A study by Ab-
dullahi et al. (2018) documented the positive out-
comes of a culturally-sensitive, group-based diabe-
tes self-management education program in Moga-
dishu [16]. Participants demonstrated improved 
knowledge of diabetes and reported adopting 
healthier dietary practices and increased physical 
activity. This initiative highlights the potential of 
community-based interventions to empower So-
mali individuals with diabetes to effectively man-
age their condition within the constraints of their 
environment. 

6. A CALL TO ACTION: CHARTING A 
COURSE FOR THE FUTURE 

Somalia faces a significant burden of diabetes 
despite having a lower prevalence compared to 
other regions. Studies like the Somali Health and 
Demographic Survey (2018-2019) indicate a con-
cerning prevalence of around 8.3% for chronic ill-
nesses, with diabetes ranking among the most 
prevalent [7]. This burden is compounded by the 
complex challenges faced by both patients and 
healthcare providers. 

Firstly, shortages of medications and supplies, 
as highlighted by the World Health Organization, 
restrict access to essential treatments like insulin 
and blood glucose monitoring tools [13]. This 
scarcity, coupled with limited healthcare infra-
structure, creates a situation where complications 
from diabetes are more likely. Secondly, conflict 
and displacement, as documented by Ahmed et al. 
(2014), disrupt treatment continuity and access to 
culturally appropriate food options, further jeop-
ardizing glycemic control [16]. 

These findings underscore the urgent need for 
further research on the specific epidemiology and 
risk factors of diabetes in Somalia. A deeper un-
derstanding of the population demographics and 
environmental factors influencing diabetes preva-
lence would be crucial for developing targeted in-
terventions. Additionally, research into the effica-
cy of culturally sensitive education programs and 
resource allocation strategies, as explored by Ab-
dullahi et al. (2018), can inform the design of 
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more effective diabetes management strategies in 
Somalia [4]. 

Somalia requires increased investment and sup-
port from international organizations and NGOs. 
Programs that address medication access, 
healthcare worker training, and community-based 
education hold immense potential to improve dia-
betes outcomes. Collaborative efforts, as exempli-
fied by the partnership between healthcare facili-
ties and the World Diabetes Foundation, demon-
strate the power of a multi-sectoral approach in 
strengthening diabetes management within Soma-
lia [3]. Investing in these areas can empower So-
malis with diabetes to manage their condition ef-
fectively and improve their overall well-being. 

7. CONCLUSION 
In conclusion, Somalia faces a significant yet 

under-researched diabetes burden, compounded by 
logistical and humanitarian challenges. Limited 
access to medications, disruptions in healthcare 
due to conflict, and a lack of culturally-sensitive 
education programs pose substantial barriers to 
effective diabetes management. However, studies 
showcasing successful community-based interven-
tions and collaborative efforts between healthcare 
facilities and international organizations provide a 
beacon of hope. Further research on the epidemi-
ology and risk factors specific to the Somali con-
text, alongside increased investment in resource 
allocation, healthcare worker training, and cultur-
ally-sensitive education, holds immense potential 
to improve diabetes outcomes in Somalia. By ad-
dressing these critical areas, Somalia can empower 
individuals with diabetes to effectively manage 
their condition and work towards a healthier fu-
ture. 
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